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Billy the Kid, Wyatt Earp, and Joaquín Murrieta are fixed in the American imagination as towering legends
of the Old West. But that has not always been the case. There was a time when these men were largely
forgotten relics of a bygone era. Then, in the early twentieth century, an obscure Chicago newspaperman
changed all that.

Walter Noble Burns (1872–1932) served with the First Kentucky Infantry during the Spanish-American War
and covered General John J. Pershing’s pursuit of Pancho Villa in Mexico as a correspondent for the
Chicago Tribune. However history-making these forays may seem, they were only the beginning. In the last
six years of his life, Burns wrote three books that propelled New Mexico outlaw Billy the Kid, Tombstone
marshal Wyatt Earp, and California bandit Joaquín Murrieta into the realm of legend.

Despite Burns’s remarkable command of his subjects—based on exhaustive research and interviews—he has
been largely ignored by scholars because of the popular, even occasionally fictional, approach he employed.
In American Mythmaker, the first literary biography of Burns, Mark J. Dworkin brings Burns out of the
shadows. Through careful analysis of The Saga of Billy the Kid (1926), Tombstone: An Iliad of the Southwest
(1927), and The Robin Hood of Eldorado: The Saga of Joaquín Murrieta (1932) and their reception,
Dworkin shows how Burns used his journalistic training to introduce the history of the American West to his
era’s general readership. In the process, Burns made his subjects household names.

Are Burns’s books fact or fiction? Was he a historian or a novelist? Dworkin considers these questions as he
uncovers the story behind Burns’s mythmaking works. A long-overdue biography of a writer who shaped our
idea of western history, American Mythmaker documents in fascinating detail the fashioning of some of the
greatest American legends.
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From reader reviews:

Bobby Bagwell:

This American Mythmaker: Walter Noble Burns and the Legends of Billy the Kid, Wyatt Earp, and Joaquín
Murrieta are generally reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The main reason
of this American Mythmaker: Walter Noble Burns and the Legends of Billy the Kid, Wyatt Earp, and
Joaquín Murrieta can be on the list of great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple
reading food but feed you with information that possibly will shock your earlier knowledge. This book will
be handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed versions.
Beside that this American Mythmaker: Walter Noble Burns and the Legends of Billy the Kid, Wyatt Earp,
and Joaquín Murrieta forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you test of
critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Robert Carlson:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic inside park. They
actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your own
personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to consider look
for book, may be the guide untitled American Mythmaker: Walter Noble Burns and the Legends of Billy the
Kid, Wyatt Earp, and Joaquín Murrieta can be great book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Rodolfo Rodgers:

The book untitled American Mythmaker: Walter Noble Burns and the Legends of Billy the Kid, Wyatt Earp,
and Joaquín Murrieta contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy
approach. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read that.
The book was compiled by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of literary works. You
can read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within
anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-
site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Kelly Blow:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh, you think
reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can have the e-
book, getting everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like American Mythmaker: Walter Noble Burns and
the Legends of Billy the Kid, Wyatt Earp, and Joaquín Murrieta which is having the e-book version. So , try
out this book? Let's view.
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