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        For nearly one hundred years, the 92nd Division of the U.S. Army in World War I has been
remembered as a military failure. The division should have been historically significant. It was the only
African American division of the American Expeditionary Forces in France. Comprised of nearly twenty-
eight thousand black soldiers, it fought in two sectors of the great battle of the Meuse-Argonne, the largest
and most costly battle in all of U.S. history. Unfortunately, when part of the 368th Infantry Regiment
collapsed in the battle’s first days, the entire division received a blow to its reputation from which it never
recovered.      

 

            In Unjustly Dishonored: An African American Division in World War I, Robert H. Ferrell challenges
long-held assumptions and asserts that the 92nd, in fact, performed quite well militarily. His investigation
was made possible by the recent recovery of a wealth of records by the National Archives. The retrieval of
lost documents allowed access to hundreds of pages of interviews, mostly from the 92nd Division’s officers,
that had never before been considered. In addition, the book uses the Army’s personal records from the
Army War College, including the newly discovered report on the 92nd’s field artillery brigade by the
enthusiastic commanding general.

 

In the first of its sectors, the Argonne, the 92nd took its objective. Its engineer regiment was a large success,
and when its artillery brigade got into action, it so pleased its general that he could not praise it enough. In
the attack of General John J. Pershing’s Second Army during the last days of the war, the 92nd captured the
Bois Frehaut, the best performance of any division of the Second Army.

 

            This book is the first full-length account of the actual accomplishments of the 92nd Division. By
framing the military outfit’s reputation against cultural context, historical accounts, and social stigmas, the
authorproves that the 92nd Division did not fail and made a valuable contribution to history that should, and
now finally can, be acknowledged. Unjustly Dishonored fills a void in the scholarship on African American
military history and World War I studies.
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Roth:

The book Unjustly Dishonored: An African American Division in World War I (American Military
Experience) can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So why must we leave a
good thing like a book Unjustly Dishonored: An African American Division in World War I (American
Military Experience)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim which book
can give many data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or
facts that you take for that, you can give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Unjustly
Dishonored: An African American Division in World War I (American Military Experience) has simple
shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by
wide open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Mary Jones:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just
watching TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is
look different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just
read you can spent all day every day to reading a e-book. The book Unjustly Dishonored: An African
American Division in World War I (American Military Experience) it is rather good to read. There are a lot
of people who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not
have enough space to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from
your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book possesses high quality.

Rigoberto Stansell:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you
need to do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of
several books in the top collection in your reading list is actually Unjustly Dishonored: An African American
Division in World War I (American Military Experience). This book which can be qualified as The Hungry
Hills can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this publication
you can get many advantages.

Brian Hill:

You can obtain this Unjustly Dishonored: An African American Division in World War I (American Military
Experience) by visit the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve trouble if
you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only simply by written or
printed but can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of



your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information
about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade.
Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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