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Get Critical Insight into the Modern Patenting Scene

We are now living in the "IP Era of the Information Age" where technology businesses are placing
increasing emphasis on intellectual property (IP) as a way to add to their bottom lines. As a consequence,
those working in a technology business or organization will inevitably be thrust into working with IP in one
or more of its various forms. This increasing emphasis on IP matters requires technology workers to have at
least a basic practical understanding of IP, particularly patents, so that they can effectively participate in their
organizations’ IP and patenting efforts.

Consider a Spherical Patent: IP and Patenting in Technology Business provides an unconventional and
unvarnished examination of patents and the reality of how they are used and abused in technology business.
The book starts with an overview of patents and how the patenting universe has become so complex, and
warns of the danger of making "spherical," simplifying assumptions about patents and patent-related matters.
It then takes a look at the cast of characters in the modern patenting world and the roles they play at the "IP
Bazaar." The book goes on to explain the increasing emphasis in today’s modern IP world of leveraging
patents in large collections of patents called "portfolios." The author describes how the fractal nature of
innovation allows for the exponential growth of patents to densely pack an "IP space," including how this
packing can exceed its normal limits and the adverse consequences. He also explores the evolution and
importance of core to improvement to commercialization patents. A modern view of patents based on
"quantum patent mechanics" explains some of the mysterious patent-related phenomena that are otherwise
inexplicable using "classical patent mechanics."

Using examples of actual patents and patent portfolios of real technology businesses, the author discusses
how patenting strategies are defined based on "central organizing principles" behind why patents are being
pursued. He describes the operational realities of running an internal patenting system as well as how to
avoid the prevalent trap of accepting a high degree of disorder (entropy) in the business’s patenting system.
He also takes a close look at other problematic areas, such as the use and abuse of provisional patent
applications and how "no shame claims" can be issued by the patent office and the havoc they can create.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Riggs:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
kind of aren't like that. This Consider a Spherical Patent: IP and Patenting in Technology Business book is
readable through you who hate those straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for
enjoyable examining experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to give to you.
The writer involving Consider a Spherical Patent: IP and Patenting in Technology Business content conveys
the thought easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but
it just different as it. So , do you continue to thinking Consider a Spherical Patent: IP and Patenting in
Technology Business is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Fanny Rutledge:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Consider a Spherical
Patent: IP and Patenting in Technology Business can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You
are consequently out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this brand new era is common not a
nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Norman Duque:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Consider a Spherical Patent: IP and Patenting in
Technology Business was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Consider
a Spherical Patent: IP and Patenting in Technology Business has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until
teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the character on
there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and loosen up.
Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading in which.

Todd Robinson:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of news. With
this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just trying to
find the Consider a Spherical Patent: IP and Patenting in Technology Business when you required it?
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