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From its humble beginning in the late 19th century?when Henry Ford’s first car was designed to run on
ethanol?biofuel production has been on the rise with more than 26 billion liters produced in the U.S. in 2007.
Ethanol made from biomass (rather than grains) holds great promise, including numerous economic and
environmental benefits. However, the adverse interactions of energy, climate, food, and soil quality cannot
be ignored.

In eight concise chapters, Soil Quality and Biofuel Production presents a state-of-the-knowledge review of
soil properties and processes negatively impacted by crop residue removal. It outlines the ecological
consequences of biofuels and evaluates land use in the production of raw material for biofuel. The book then
spotlights pressing issues related to corn and cellulosic ethanol and also soil erosion. It offers advice for
achieving economic balance in the competition for arable land between food and biofuel along with residue
harvest management techniques. A thought-provoking discussion of the opportunities and challenges that
biofuel presents rounds out the book’s coverage.

The logistics of producing biomass in a sustainable manner remain a major challenge and will continue to be
so for the foreseeable future. Serious questions linger concerning viable sources of biofuel feedstock,
competition for resources needed to produce biomass, and energy output/input ratios. Soil Quality and
Biofuel Production provides environmental scientists and agricultural engineers with the knowledge they
need to address them.
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From reader reviews:

Betty Benner:

This Soil Quality and Biofuel Production (Advances in Soil Science) book is just not ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is usually
information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a
lot of information you will get. This kind of Soil Quality and Biofuel Production (Advances in Soil Science)
without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't
always be worry Soil Quality and Biofuel Production (Advances in Soil Science) can bring when you are and
not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it within your lovely
laptop even mobile phone. This Soil Quality and Biofuel Production (Advances in Soil Science) having
excellent arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Olga Andres:

Exactly why? Because this Soil Quality and Biofuel Production (Advances in Soil Science) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will jolt you with the secret it
inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such awesome way makes
the content interior easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning completely. So , it
is good for you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This amazing book will
give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such as help improving your expertise and your critical
thinking means. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I had been you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Rochelle Barrick:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can
know everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This reserve Soil Quality and Biofuel Production (Advances in Soil Science) was
filled regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some
people has distinct feel when they reading the book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can
experience enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you wanted.

Cheryl Edgerly:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen want book to know the revise information of year in order to year. As we know those guides
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By the
book Soil Quality and Biofuel Production (Advances in Soil Science) we can consider more advantage. Don't
that you be creative people? Being creative person must love to read a book. Only choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book Soil Quality and Biofuel
Production (Advances in Soil Science). You can more attractive than now.
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