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A bighearted dystopian novel about the corrosive effects of fear and the redemptive power of love.

With soaring literary prose and the tense pacing of a thriller, the first-time novelist Peyton Marshall imagines
a grim and startling future. At the end of the twenty-first century—in a transformed America—the sons of
convicted felons are tested for a set of genetic markers. Boys who test positive become compulsory wards of
the state—removed from their homes and raised on "Goodhouse" campuses, where they learn to reform their
darkest thoughts and impulses. Goodhouse is a savage place—part prison, part boarding school—and now a
radical religious group, the Holy Redeemer's Church of Purity, is intent on destroying each campus and
purifying every child with fire.
We see all this through the eyes of James, a transfer student who watched as the radicals set fire to his old
Goodhouse and killed nearly everyone he'd ever known. In addition to adjusting to a new campus with new
rules, James now has to contend with Bethany, a brilliant, medically fragile girl who wants to save him, and
with her father, the school's sinister director of medical studies. Soon, however, James realizes that the
biggest threat might already be there, inside the fortified walls of Goodhouse itself.Partly based on the true
story of the nineteenth-century Preston School of Industry, Goodhouse explores questions of identity and
free will—and what it means to test the limits of human endurance.
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From reader reviews:

Jonathan McLean:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the book entitled Goodhouse: A Novel. Try to face the book Goodhouse: A
Novel as your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you sense alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes
you a lot more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let's make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Pamela Garcia:

This Goodhouse: A Novel are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The reason why of
this Goodhouse: A Novel can be one of many great books you must have is actually giving you more than
just simple looking at food but feed a person with information that probably will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Goodhouse: A Novel giving you an enormous of
experience like rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day
pastime. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Francis Griffin:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not striving Goodhouse: A Novel that
give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading habit all over the world
can be said as the opportunity for people to know world better then how they react towards the world. It can't
be claimed constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to be
success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good habit, you may pick Goodhouse: A
Novel become your personal starter.

Jose Crawford:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for your requirements is Goodhouse: A Novel this e-book consist a lot of the information from
the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world has grown up.
The dialect styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some study when
he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suited all of you.
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