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How did the city-state of Athens defeat the invaders from Persia, the first world empire, on the plain of
Marathon in 490 BCE? Clever scholars skeptical of our earliest surviving source, Herodotus, have produced
one ingenious theory after another. In this stimulating new book, bound to provoke controversy, Peter Krentz
argues that Herodotus was right after all.

Beginning his analysis with the Athenians’ first formal contact with the Persians in 507 BCE, Krentz weaves
together ancient evidence with travelers’ descriptions, archaeological discoveries, geological surveys, and
the experiences of modern reenactors and soldiers to tell his story.

Krentz argues that before Marathon the Athenian army fought in a much less organized way than the
standard view of the hoplite phalanx suggests: as an irregularly armed mob rather than a disciplined
formation of identically equipped infantry. At Marathon the Athenians equipped all their fighters, including
archers and horsemen, as hoplites for the first time. Because their equipment weighed only half as much as is
usually thought, the Athenians and their Plataean allies could charge almost a mile at a run, as Herodotus
says they did. Krentz improves on this account in Herodotus by showing why the Athenians wanted to do
such a risky thing.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Wiersma:

This The Battle of Marathon (Yale Library of Military History) book is just not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book will be information inside
this e-book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information
you will get. That The Battle of Marathon (Yale Library of Military History) without we recognize teach the
one who looking at it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry The Battle of
Marathon (Yale Library of Military History) can bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even cell phone. This The
Battle of Marathon (Yale Library of Military History) having excellent arrangement in word in addition to
layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Virginia Cherry:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new facts. When
you read a publication you will get new information due to the fact book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or even their idea. Second, examining a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially hype book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read this The Battle
of Marathon (Yale Library of Military History), you could tells your family, friends and soon about yours
publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Carol Johnson:

This The Battle of Marathon (Yale Library of Military History) is great e-book for you because the content
and that is full of information for you who also always deal with world and still have to make decision every
minute. This kind of book reveal it facts accurately using great organize word or we can state no rambling
sentences included. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides straight forward sentences but difficult core information with attractive delivering sentences.
Having The Battle of Marathon (Yale Library of Military History) in your hand like having the world in your
arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no book that offer you world throughout ten or
fifteen second right but this reserve already do that. So , this is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. hectic
do you still doubt in which?

Patricia McGuire:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the
library or even make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's
internal or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to



generally there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your
case. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many
ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this The Battle of Marathon (Yale Library of Military History)
can make you experience more interested to read.
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