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Advances in research have led to the use of robotics in a range of surgical applications. Medical robotics:
Minimally invasive surgery provides authoritative coverage of the core principles, applications and future
potential of this enabling technology.

Beginning with an introduction to robot-assisted minimally invasive surgery (MIS), the core technologies of
the field are discussed, including localization and tracking technologies for medical robotics. Key
applications of robotics in laparoscopy, neurology, cardiovascular interventions, urology and orthopaedics
are considered, as well as applications for ear, nose and throat (ENT) surgery, vitreoretinal surgery and
natural orifice transluminal endoscopic surgery (NOTES). Microscale mobile robots for the circulatory
system and mesoscale robots for the gastrointestinal tract are investigated, as is MRI-based navigation for in
vivo magnetic microrobots. Finally, the book concludes with a discussion of ethical issues related to the use
of robotics in surgery.

With its distinguished editor and international team of expert contributors, Medical robotics: Minimally
invasive surgery is a comprehensive guide for all those working in the research, design, development and
application of medical robotics for surgery. It also provides an authoritative introduction for academics and
medical practitioners working in this field.

Provides authoritative coverage of the core principles, applications and future potential of medical robotics●

Introduces robot-assisted minimally invasive surgery (MIS), including the core technologies of the field●

and localization and tracking technologies for medical robotics
Considers key applications of robotics in laparoscopy, neurology, cardiovascular interventions, urology and●

orthopaedics
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From reader reviews:

Mark Ames:

Book is definitely written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A guide Medical Robotics: Minimally
Invasive Surgery (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) will make you to be smarter. You can feel
far more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think that will open or reading
some sort of book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in
search of best book or acceptable book with you?

James Collins:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you is
you don't know which one you should start with. This Medical Robotics: Minimally Invasive Surgery
(Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Brian Rocha:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book mainly book entitled Medical
Robotics: Minimally Invasive Surgery (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) your brain will drift
away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can
become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then become one form conclusion
and explanation that maybe you never get previous to. The Medical Robotics: Minimally Invasive Surgery
(Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) giving you another experience more than blown away your
thoughts but also giving you useful facts for your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate
the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished studying it,
like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Denise Adams:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you read
a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with soon.
The Medical Robotics: Minimally Invasive Surgery (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) will give
you new experience in reading through a book.
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