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Starting Your Career as an Interior Designer contains all the necessary tools and strategies to successfully
launch and grow a professional design business in the competitive world of interior design. Drawing on the
authors' extensive experience, this book includes case studies, and personal anecdotes that help teach you
how to:
- choose a design field - obtain and keep clients - garner referrals - market and position your business - bid
competitively on projects - manage sales - organize a budget - manage start-up costs and cash flow - promote
your business - branch out into product and architectural design - design within a retail environment - set
pricing guidelines - sell to your target demographic - set up your office. Readers will find a history of the
business side of interior design as well as various career tracks available to today’s budding entrepreneur.
Any early career interior designer or student looking for practical advice on the ins and outs of running a
design firm will need this one-stop guide.

Allworth Press, an imprint of Skyhorse Publishing, publishes a broad range of books on the visual and
performing arts, with emphasis on the business of art. Our titles cover subjects such as graphic design,
theater, branding, fine art, photography, interior design, writing, acting, film, how to start careers, business
and legal forms, business practices, and more. While we don't aspire to publish a New York Times bestseller
or a national bestseller, we are deeply committed to quality books that help creative professionals succeed
and thrive. We often publish in areas overlooked by other publishers and welcome the author whose
expertise can help our audience of readers.
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From reader reviews:

Rachel Robertson:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that
e-book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Starting Your Career as an Interior Designer.

Jason Dolly:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open as well as read a book called Starting Your Career
as an Interior Designer? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend
your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with the opinion or
you have some other opinion?

Maria Casillas:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get
a lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about
the ability about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this
Starting Your Career as an Interior Designer.

Patrick Myers:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be Starting Your Career as an Interior Designer why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is
definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick
up this book.
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