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From an Antagonistic to a Synergistic Predator Prey Perspective: Bifurcations in Marine Ecosystems is a
groundbreaking reference that challenges the widespread perception that predators generally have a negative
impact on the abundance of their prey, and it proposes a novel paradigm — Predator-prey Synergism — in
which both predator and prey enhance abundance by their co-existence. Using this model, the text explains a
number of issues that appear paradoxical in the case of a negative predator-prey relationship, including
observed ecosystem bifurcations (regime shifts), ecosystem resilience, red tides in apparently nutrient
depleted water, and the dominance of grazed phytoplankton over non-grazed species under high grazing
pressure. This novel paradigm can also be used to predict the potential impact of global warming on marine
ecosystems, identify how marine ecosystem may respond to gradual environmental changes, and develop
possible measures to mitigate the negative impact of increasing temperature in marine ecosystems. This book
approaches the long-standing question of what generates recruitment variability in marine fishes and
invertebrates in an engaging and unique way that students and researchers in marine ecosystems will
understand.

Introduces a new paradigm, Predator-prey Synergism, as a building block on which to construct new●

ecological theories. It suggests that Predator-prey Synergism is important in some terrestrial ecosystems
and is in agreement with the punctuated equilibria theory of evolution (i.e., stepwise evolution).
Suggests a general solution to the recruitment puzzle in marine organisms●

Proposes a holistic hypothesis for marine spring blooming ecosystems by considering variability enhancing●

and variability dampening processes
Asserts that fisheries will induce variability in marine ecosystems and alter the energy flow patterns in●

predictable ways
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Cyr:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important for people. The book From an Antagonistic to a Synergistic Predator Prey
Perspective: Bifurcations in Marine Ecosystem was making you to know about other information and of
course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The e-book From an Antagonistic
to a Synergistic Predator Prey Perspective: Bifurcations in Marine Ecosystem is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also being your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend
your own spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship while using book From an Antagonistic
to a Synergistic Predator Prey Perspective: Bifurcations in Marine Ecosystem. You never experience lose out
for everything in case you read some books.

Billy Gallardo:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book,
and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended to you is From an Antagonistic to a Synergistic Predator Prey Perspective: Bifurcations in
Marine Ecosystem this book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This
particular book was represented how do the world has grown up. The language styles that writer require to
explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some investigation when he makes this book.
Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.

Barbara McGowan:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading
through a book. Ugh, think reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like From an
Antagonistic to a Synergistic Predator Prey Perspective: Bifurcations in Marine Ecosystem which is
obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Hector Medlin:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This specific book From an Antagonistic to a Synergistic
Predator Prey Perspective: Bifurcations in Marine Ecosystem was colorful and of course has pictures on
there. As we know that book From an Antagonistic to a Synergistic Predator Prey Perspective: Bifurcations
in Marine Ecosystem has many kinds or category. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Private eye Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are generally



make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you and try to
like reading in which.
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