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The developments of early 2011 changes the political landscape of the Middle East. But even as urgent
struggles continue, it remains clear that authoritarianism will survive this transformational moment. The
study of authoritarian governance, therefore, remains essential for our understanding of the political
dynamics and inner workings of regimes across the region.

This volume considers the Syrian and Iranian regimes—what they share in common and what distinguishes
them. Too frequently, authoritarianism has been assumed to be a generic descriptor of the region and
differences among regimes have been overlooked. But as the political trajectories of Middle Eastern states
diverge in years ahead, with some perhaps consolidating democratic gains while others remaining under
distinct and resilient forms of authoritarian rule, understanding variations in modes of authoritarian
governance and the attributes that promote regime resilience becomes an increasingly urgent priority.
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From reader reviews:

Bertha Costa:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice simply by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific Middle East Authoritarianisms:
Governance, Contestation, and Regime Resilience in Syria and Iran (Stanford Studies in Middle Eastern and
I) book as beginning and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Phillip Ruiz:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want attract knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want sense happy read one with
theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The Middle East Authoritarianisms: Governance, Contestation,
and Regime Resilience in Syria and Iran (Stanford Studies in Middle Eastern and I) is kind of book which is
giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Terri Mitchell:

This book untitled Middle East Authoritarianisms: Governance, Contestation, and Regime Resilience in
Syria and Iran (Stanford Studies in Middle Eastern and I) to be one of several books which best seller in this
year, honestly, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to
buy this kind of book in the book retailer or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of the book
sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile
phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Amanda Furr:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Middle East
Authoritarianisms: Governance, Contestation, and Regime Resilience in Syria and Iran (Stanford Studies in
Middle Eastern and I) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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