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Rainbow Jews deals with the intersection of gay and Jewish identity in American and Israeli film and theater,
from the 1960s to the present. Its main area of interest is the extent to which Jewish creative voices in the
performing arts have constructed multidimensional images of, and a welcoming public space for, the gay,
lesbian, and transgendered community as a whole. Through a close reading of the texts of numerous
American and Israeli plays and films (some famous, but mostly lesser known), the author evaluates some of
the key conventions and tropes that have been employed to construct, critique, and reflect the social reality of
the connection between Jewishness and gay identity in the United States and Israel. Secondarily, the author
explores ways in which gay-Jewish playwrights and filmmakers have assisted the re-evaluation of sexual
norms within Judaism over the past three decades, inspiring and reinforcing measures across the spectrum of
belief geared towards integrating Jewish members of the GLBT community into the overall Jewish historical
narrative.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Young:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Rainbow Jews: Jewish and Gay Identity in
the Performing Arts is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

Odessa Currie:

The feeling that you get from Rainbow Jews: Jewish and Gay Identity in the Performing Arts could be the
more deep you searching the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but Rainbow Jews: Jewish and Gay Identity in the
Performing Arts giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in selected way
that can be understood by simply anyone who read that because the author of this reserve is well-known
enough. That book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand
then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this
specific Rainbow Jews: Jewish and Gay Identity in the Performing Arts instantly.

Norma Eberhart:

Often the book Rainbow Jews: Jewish and Gay Identity in the Performing Arts will bring you to definitely
the new experience of reading any book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try
to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The book Rainbow Jews: Jewish and Gay Identity in
the Performing Arts is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from the
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Wanda Hardin:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Rainbow Jews: Jewish and Gay Identity in the Performing Arts why
because the wonderful cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you actually.
The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly
show you to pick up this book.
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