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Do You Have a Game Plan?

Premier agent Drew Pittman loves sports. Maybe even more than you do. But an experience early in his
management career convinced him that a life of significance is about faith, family, and football--and always
in that order. So how do you make significance your game plan?

Competitive sports are filled with lessons about motivation, perseverance, hard work, and collaboration--and
these lessons are powerfully transferable to everyday life. Yet few men apply them to the most important
arena they'll ever play in: their home.

In First Team Dad, Drew Pittman shares the principles that can change the game in your family, straight
from a sports insider who has field-tested each and every one with his home team. With heart-pounding
stories of unforgettable plays and one-in-a-million players, First Team Dad is your ticket to create a legacy
of significance in your family.

"It's my hope that by reading First Team Dad you will be motivated to do a better job of leading your family
and that you will reach out to other men you know to help them catch this vision."--Tony Dungy, former
NFL head coach and bestselling author

"Knowing Drew, I've been encouraged and challenged by his example and wisdom--read this book so you
can get to know this man as well."--John Schneider, executive vice president and general manager, Seattle
Seahawks

"To the football fan's delight, Drew shares behind-the-scenes stories about his experiences with famous
players and coaches in order to demonstrate practical points about having a strong family. I believe every
man who reads this book will walk away inspired and will have a game plan for his own family."--Robert
Morris, founding senior pastor, Gateway Church, Dallas Texas; bestselling author, The Blessed Life
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From reader reviews:

Omar Yoder:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important normally. The book First Team Dad: Your Playbook for a Winning
Family seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more
information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The guide First Team Dad: Your Playbook for a
Winning Family is not only giving you considerably more new information but also to become your friend
when you sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship
with the book First Team Dad: Your Playbook for a Winning Family. You never feel lose out for everything
when you read some books.

Margaretta Lee:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just
watching TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is
look different you can read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you read you
can spent all day long to reading a publication. The book First Team Dad: Your Playbook for a Winning
Family it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. We were holding
enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the actual
e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but
this book has high quality.

Bernetta Smith:

You could spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This First Team Dad: Your Playbook for a
Winning Family is simple bringing you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you
did not possess much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you
easier to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.

Sandra Wright:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This First Team Dad: Your Playbook for a
Winning Family can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date,
spending your free time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
books have than the others?
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