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Hermes is the Greek god of the Word, of thought and magic, the swift-moving messenger of the Divine and
guardian of souls in the Afterlife. In Ancient Egypt he was the majestic god Thoth, the Recorder, the lord of
measurement and science, the brother/husband of Isis. In Rome, he was of course Mercury, flying through
the Empyrean at the speed of idea by the aid of his winged helmet and boots.

In this broad survey of the Hermetic arts, author Jacob Slavenburg brings an unparalleled depth of insight to
the subject. He examines the historical Hermetic literature and details its relevance to modern occultism,
from the symbolism of architecture and art to the mysteries of Freemasonry. The heavenly mysteries of
astrology are explored as are the healing arts which derive from the spirit of scientific inquiry embodied by
Thoth/Hermes. Slavenburg examines the magical writings of the Greek papyri and their development into the
contemporary magical practices of modern adepts.

He sheds light on the workings of alchemy and the esoteric philosophy to the world of modern chemistry and
physics. He explores the origin of evil and the realm of the afterlife, and the Hermetic doctrines of
reincarnation and karma. In addition, the author provides a wealth of biographical data on the magi of
Hermeticsm, from Ficino to Agrippa, John Dee to Giordano Bruno.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Rhone:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the book entitled The Hermetic Link: From Secret Tradition to Modern
Thought. Try to stumble through book The Hermetic Link: From Secret Tradition to Modern Thought as
your buddy. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that course make you
smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you considerably
more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we should make new experience and
also knowledge with this book.

Sharon Wilson:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline The Hermetic
Link: From Secret Tradition to Modern Thought suitable to you? The book was written by well known writer
in this era. Often the book untitled The Hermetic Link: From Secret Tradition to Modern Thoughtis the main
of several books in which everyone read now. This book was inspired a number of people in the world.
When you read this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever know previous to. The author explained
their idea in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book
will give you a wide range of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world
in this particular book.

Lawrence Caulfield:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only situation that share in the textbooks. But also they write
about the knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to
improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of
them is this The Hermetic Link: From Secret Tradition to Modern Thought.

Scott Bourquin:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The Hermetic Link:
From Secret Tradition to Modern Thought which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's



see.
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