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For weeks that fall, the body count of sexually violated, brutally murdered young women escalated. With
increasing alarm, Los Angeles newspapers headlined the deeds of a serial killer they named the Hillside
Strangler. The city was held hostage to fear.
 
But not until January 1979, more than a year later, would the mysterious disappearance of two university
students near Seattle lead police to the arrest of a security guard—the handsome, charming, fast-talking
Kenny Bianchi—and the discovery that the strangler was not one man but two.
 
Like Truman Capote in In Cold Blood and Norman Mailer in The Executioner’s Song, Darcy O’Brien weds
the narrative skill of an award-winning novelist with the detailed observations of an experienced investigator
to unravel, in The Hillside Stranglers, the chilling true-crime story of Bianchi and his animally magnetic
cousin Angelo Buono. Compellingly, O’Brien explores the symbiotic relationship between the two men,
their lust for women as insatiable as their hate, before examining the crimes they remorselessly perpetrated
and the lives of the unsuspecting victims they claimed.
 
Equally riveting is O’Brien’s account of the trial—one of the longest and most controversial criminal court
cases in American history—with the defense team parading, one after another, expert witnesses who had
been effectively duped by Bianchi’s impersonation of a man suffering multiple personality disorder. It’s one
way a man might contrive to get away with murder.
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From reader reviews:

Teressa Fernandez:

The book The Hillside Stranglers gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to
make your capable a lot more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting strain or
having big problem using your subject. If you can make reading through a book The Hillside Stranglers for
being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about
many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like start and read a book The Hillside Stranglers.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think
about this guide?

Mamie Perkins:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to you is you don't know which you should start with. This The Hillside Stranglers is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this
era.

Walton Han:

This The Hillside Stranglers are usually reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The
reason why of this The Hillside Stranglers can be one of the great books you must have is giving you more
than just simple studying food but feed you actually with information that maybe will shock your previous
knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions
at e-book and printed ones. Beside that this The Hillside Stranglers forcing you to have an enormous of
experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your
day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Allison Lyon:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for you is The Hillside Stranglers this reserve consist a lot of the information on the condition
of this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some study when he
makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.
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