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For four decades Professional Investor and its predecessor, Investment Analyst, the journal of The Institute
of Investment Management and Research, has been publishing sound investment advice on topical issues
from leading experts in the field.

The articles in this collection cover financial subjects ranging from the first introduction computers to
mathematical techniques into finance, through the oil crisis years, to the valuation of brands, intellectual
property and goodwill. Each article provides a fascinating insight both into the subject concerned and into
contemporary thinking at the time of writing. All the articles have been selected for their significance to the
financial world today. These fascinating articles are as relevant today as when first written.

The Institute of Investment management and Research (IIMR) is the professional Examining body for
investment analysts and fund managers in the UK. It provides the 'Threshold Competence' examination for
fund managers and analysts, in addition to a six paper Associate examination.

The Institute was founded in 1955 as the Society of Investment Analysts and changed its name in 1992. It
was a founding member of EFFAS and has close links with AIMR in the US.

Professional Investor is the journal of the IIMR and is published ten times a year.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Parrish:

With other case, little people like to read book Double Takes (Wiley Investment (Hardcover)). You can
choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. So long as we know about how is important the book
Double Takes (Wiley Investment (Hardcover)). You can add know-how and of course you can around the
world with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can understand everything! From your
country until finally foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple point until wonderful thing you
may know that. In this era, we can open a book or even searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You
should use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's study.

Kimberly Towe:

The book Double Takes (Wiley Investment (Hardcover)) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing like a book Double Takes (Wiley
Investment (Hardcover))? A few of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give
many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or info
that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Double Takes
(Wiley Investment (Hardcover)) has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You
can appearance the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Mildred Vang:

Do you one among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Double Takes (Wiley Investment (Hardcover)) book is readable through
you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable looking at
experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer connected
with Double Takes (Wiley Investment (Hardcover)) content conveys the idea easily to understand by many
individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different in the form of it. So ,
do you nevertheless thinking Double Takes (Wiley Investment (Hardcover)) is not loveable to be your top
collection reading book?

Ian Bracy:

A lot of book has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as of book
Double Takes (Wiley Investment (Hardcover)). You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without departing
the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most crucial that, you
must aware about guide. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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