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What is the meaning of a word? Most readers turn to the dictionary for authoritative meanings and correct
usage. But what is the source of authority in dictionaries? Some dictionaries employ panels of experts to fix
meaning and prescribe usage, others rely on derivation through etymology. But perhaps no other dictionary
has done more to standardize the English language than the formidable twenty-volume Oxford English
Dictionary in its 1989 second edition. Yet this most Victorian of modern dictionaries derives its meaning by
citing the earliest known usage of words and by demonstrating shades of meaning through an awesome
database of over five million examples of usage in context. In this fascinating study, John Willinsky
challenges the authority of this imperial dictionary, revealing many of its inherent prejudices and questioning
the assumptions of its ongoing revision. "Clearly, the OED is no simple record of the language `as she is
spoke,'" Willinsky writes. "It is a selective representation reflecting certain elusive ideas about the nature of
the English language and people. Empire of Words reveals, by statistic and table, incident and anecdote, how
serendipitous, judgmental, and telling a task editing a dictionary such as the OED can be."

Willinsky analyzes the favored citation records from the three editorial periods of the OED's compilation: the
Victorian, imperial first edition; the modern supplement; and the contemporary second edition composed on
an electronic database. He reveals shifts in linguistic authority: the original edition relied on English
literature and, surprisingly, on translations, reference works, and journalism; the modern editions have
shifted emphasis to American sources and periodicals while continuing to neglect women, workers, and
other English-speaking countries.

Willinsky's dissection of dictionary entries exposes contradictions and ambiguities in the move from citation
to definition. He points out that Shakespeare, the most frequently cited authority in the OED, often
confounds the dictionary's simple sense of meaning with his wit and artfulness. He shows us how the most
famous four-letter words in the language found their way through a belabored editorial process, sweating and
grunting, into the supplement to the OED. Willinsky sheds considerable light on how the OED continues to
shape the English language through the sometimes idiosyncratic, often biased selection of citations by hired
readers and impassioned friends of the language.

Anyone who is fascinated with words and language will find Willinsky's tour through the OED a delightful
and stimulating experience. No one who reads this book will ever feel quite the same about Murray's web of
words.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Bruns:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great along with important the book Empire of Words: The Reign of the
OED. All type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for the internet sources or other
social media.

Pearl Moore:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information especially this Empire of Words: The Reign of the OED
book since this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Christopher Parker:

The particular book Empire of Words: The Reign of the OED has a lot of information on it. So when you
read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous author. Mcdougal
makes some research previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you can get the point easily
after scanning this book.

Hazel Mercado:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Empire of Words: The Reign of the
OED can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your
spare time by reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than
the others?
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