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Born in 1917 into an aristocratic Boston family Robert Lowell was not yet thirty when his first major
collection of poems, Lord Weary's Castle, won the Pulitzer Prize. With Life Studies, his third book, he found
the intense, highly personal voice that made him the foremost American poet of his generation. He held
strong, complex and very public political views. His private life was turbulent, marred by manic depression
and troubled marriages. But in this superb biography (first published in 1982) the poet Ian Hamilton
illuminates both the life and the work of Lowell with sympathetic understanding and consummate narrative
skill.

'Our one consolation for Ian Hamilton's early death is that his work seems to have lived on with
undiminished force... The critical prose, in particular, still sets a standard that nobody else comes near.' Clive
James
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From reader reviews:

Christina Fitts:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you want something
to explain what yours problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare time to
accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that question simply because just
their can do that. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on guardería until university need this Robert Lowell: A Biography to read.

Steven Cordell:

The publication untitled Robert Lowell: A Biography is the e-book that recommended to you you just read.
You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to a person. The language that writer
use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
study when write the book, hence the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also
could get the e-book of Robert Lowell: A Biography from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free
time.

Cleta Blackwell:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get
wide range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, typically
the book you have read is definitely Robert Lowell: A Biography.

Mark Adair:

You could spend your free time to read this book this publication. This Robert Lowell: A Biography is
simple to create you can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not have got much
space to bring the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You
can save often the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you
buy this book.
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