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An internationally renowned energy expert has written a book essential for every American–a galvanizing
account of how the rising price and diminishing availability of oil are going to radically change our lives.
Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot Smaller is a powerful and provocative book that explores
what the new global economy will look like and what it will mean for all of us.

In a compelling and accessible style, Jeff Rubin reveals that despite the recent recessionary dip, oil prices
will skyrocket again once the economy recovers. The fact is, worldwide oil reserves are disappearing for
good. Consequently, the amount of food and other goods we get from abroad will be curtailed; long-distance
driving will become a luxury and international travel rare. Globalization as we know it will reverse. The near
future will be a time that, in its physical limits, may resemble the distant past.

But Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot Smaller is a hopeful work about how we can
benefit–personally, politically, and economically–from this new reality. American industries such as steel
and agriculture, for instance, will be revitalized. As well, Rubin prescribes priorities for President Obama
and other leaders, from imposing carbon tariffs that will increase competition and productivity, to investing
in mass transit instead of car-clogged highways, to forging “green” alliances between labor and management
that will be good for both business and the air we breathe.

Most passionately, Rubin recommends ways every citizen can secure this better life for himself, actions that
will end our enslavement to chain-store taste and strengthen our communities and timeless human values.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Barry Upshaw:

The book Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot Smaller: Oil and the End of Globalization can give
more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave the good thing like a book
Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot Smaller: Oil and the End of Globalization? Some of you have
a different opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper.
Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may give for
each other; you can share all of these. Book Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot Smaller: Oil and
the End of Globalization has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for you. You can
appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Richard Stratton:

Often the book Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot Smaller: Oil and the End of Globalization has
a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was
compiled by the very famous author. The author makes some research prior to write this book. This specific
book very easy to read you may get the point easily after looking over this book.

Jon Harrill:

In this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top
checklist in your reading list is Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot Smaller: Oil and the End of
Globalization. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing to be
precious person. By looking right up and review this book you can get many advantages.

Eugene Williams:

Some individuals said that they feel fed up when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot
Smaller: Oil and the End of Globalization to make your own reading is interesting. Your own personal skill
of reading expertise is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to
read it and mingle the sensation about book and examining especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like
to open up a book and go through it. Beside that the guide Why Your World Is About to Get a Whole Lot
Smaller: Oil and the End of Globalization can to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and
confuse in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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