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Building on the success of the popular first edition, the author tackles the latest issues and practices in the
field of classroom assessment. The No Child Left Behind Act has transformed the role of educational
assessment, requiring annual assessments as part of a federal system of educational accountability. National
accreditation organizations such NCATE have mandated standards-based performance and emphasized
specific assessment benchmarks in meeting these standards. The inclusion movement to accommodate
special-needs students in the regular education classroom also has impacted classroom assessment practices.
Teacher assessment, classroom environment, test anxiety, the Race to the Top grants, and many more timely
topics receive comprehensive yet accessible treatment. Banks provides thorough and well-documented
discussions of performance assessment, essay and multiple-choice assessments, formative assessment, and
reliability/validity issues as well as invaluable classroom assessment tools that include portfolios, rubrics,
journals, and models such as Anderson and Krathwohl’s revision of Bloom’s Taxonomy. Gender and
diversity issues, including learning differences and socioeconomic influences on student achievement, are
given in-depth coverage. Outstanding features include case studies, point/counterpoint debates on
controversial assessment topics and practices, teacher application exercises, thought-provoking self-
assessment exercises, and end-of-chapter activities that include review questions and opportunities for
directed learning.
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From reader reviews:

Jonathan Woods:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled Classroom Assessment: Issues and Practices. Try to the actual book
Classroom Assessment: Issues and Practices as your friend. It means that it can being your friend when you
feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The
book makes you far more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let's make new
experience along with knowledge with this book.

Carlos Reese:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you
require something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular
person? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored
faster. And you have spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should
answer that question since just their can do this. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes,
it is appropriate. Because start from on pre-school until university need this Classroom Assessment: Issues
and Practices to read.

Donald Mobley:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and family or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read any book. It is
really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a reserve. The
book Classroom Assessment: Issues and Practices it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of
people that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have
enough space to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this
book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high quality.

Scott Bourquin:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose often the book Classroom Assessment: Issues and
Practices to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading proficiency is developing
when you such as reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle
the sensation about book and reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a
book and examine it. Beside that the e-book Classroom Assessment: Issues and Practices can to be your
friend when you're sense alone and confuse with what must you're doing of the time.
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