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Operating managers, in tandem with accountants, consultants, and IT specialists, are constantly faced with
the task of designing internal controls. Then, these same individuals, as well as independent external auditors
and internal auditors, must evaluate existing systems of control, including recommending and implementing
changes to existing control systems. This third edition of Internal Controls Guide (previously published as
Handbook of Internal Accounting Controls) is written for CPAs, internal auditors, system designers,
controllers, operating managers, small business owners, not-for-profit administrators, consultants, and
directors. Following the passage of the Sarbanes-Oxley Act in 2002, managers are required to make
representations regarding their controls and CPAs are required to perform a related attestation service. The
Public Company Accounting Oversight Board (PCAOB) issued Auditing Standard No. 2, “An Audit of
Internal Control over Financial Reporting Performed in Conjunction with an Audit of Financial Statements,”
in June 2004, requiring accelerated public company filers (those seasoned companies with public float
exceeding $75 million) to comply with internal control reporting and disclosure requirements for fiscal years
ending on or after November 15, 2004. Other public companies, including smaller companies, foreign
private issuers, and those entities only issuing registered debt securities, must comply for fiscal years ending
July 15, 2005. This book provides a roadmap for effective and efficient planning for control documentation,
monitoring, and follow-up activities. The requirements of Auditing Standard No. 2 are reflected in forms,
checklists, and efficiency suggestions throughout the book. Guidance still applicable to nonpublic entities is
similarly addressed. This Guide describes in practical terms the critical elements of internal control then,
step-by-step, demonstrates how to evaluate and improve these elements for each of the major operating
cycles of a business.
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From reader reviews:

Freddy Lamberth:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you is you don't
know what kind you should start with. This Internal Controls Guide (Third Edition) is our recommendation
so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Leigh Brown:

This book untitled Internal Controls Guide (Third Edition) to be one of several books in which best seller in
this year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily
to buy this book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your Cell
phone. So there is no reason to you to past this e-book from your list.

Salvador Swain:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
learn a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of
book that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, along
with soon. The Internal Controls Guide (Third Edition) provide you with a new experience in examining a
book.

Jennifer Knott:

Is it a person who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Internal Controls Guide (Third Edition) can be the
answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by reading
in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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