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Based on first-hand accounts and extensive fieldwork, Unfree in Palestine reveals the role played by identity
documents in Israel’s apartheid policies towards the Palestinians, from the red passes of the 1950s to the
orange, green and blue passes of today.

The authors chronicle how millions of Palestinians have been denationalised through the bureaucratic tools
of census, population registration, blacklisting and a discriminatory legal framework. They show how
identity documents are used by Israel as a means of coercion, extortion, humiliation and informant
recruitment. Movement restrictions tied to IDs and population registers threaten Palestinian livelihoods,
freedom of movement and access to basic services such as health and education.

Unfree in Palestine is a masterful expose of the web of bureaucracy used by Israel to deprive the Palestinians
of basic rights and freedoms, and calls for international justice and inclusive security in place of
discrimination and division.
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Dietz:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A guide Unfree in Palestine: Registration, Documentation
and Movement Restriction will make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about anything. But some of you think which open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you
fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you seeking best book or appropriate book with you?

Gregg Spencer:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold
on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Unfree in Palestine: Registration, Documentation and Movement
Restriction book is readable by means of you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here
are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to
give to you. The writer associated with Unfree in Palestine: Registration, Documentation and Movement
Restriction content conveys thinking easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not
different in the content material but it just different available as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Unfree
in Palestine: Registration, Documentation and Movement Restriction is not loveable to be your top listing
reading book?

Sandra Phillips:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a reserve you will get new information mainly because book is one of many ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make you more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story
how the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this Unfree in Palestine: Registration, Documentation and Movement Restriction, you may tells your family,
friends and also soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a
guide.

Christopher Gaul:

Unfree in Palestine: Registration, Documentation and Movement Restriction can be one of your basic books
that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that may
increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into delight arrangement in writing
Unfree in Palestine: Registration, Documentation and Movement Restriction however doesn't forget the main



position, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource information that maybe you can be
certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into new stage of crucial thinking.
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