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As the country grows increasingly diverse and complicated, Americans seek, and occasionally find, a
common thread to unite them. And, as Jim Lilliefors reveals in his new book, that common thread is what the
baseball cap is made of — indeed, what has transformed it into America’s National Hat. As fads go, it’s no
longer even a fad, but a part of the national identity that, for better or worse, is a symbol of America. It feeds
an illusion that Americans cherish — that despite their differences, and no matter what position they play —
when wearing a baseball cap, they’re all part of the same team. Exploring every aspect of caps and their
culture — including the history, manufacturing, and evolution of baseball caps; collecting and caring for
caps; cap etiquette; and even cap urban legends — and packed with photos throughout, Ball Cap Nation is a
delightful look at a uniquely American phenomenon.
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From reader reviews:

John Frank:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something
that they don't would like do that. You must know how great and important the book Ball Cap Nation: A
Journey Through the World of America's National Hat. All type of book are you able to see on many
options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Cindy Moats:

This book untitled Ball Cap Nation: A Journey Through the World of America's National Hat to be one of
several books that best seller in this year, here is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of
benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it by way of
online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you
can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you to past this guide from your list.

Ann Fortune:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking Ball Cap Nation: A Journey
Through the World of America's National Hat that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied
through reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the means for people to know
world far better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading
routine only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So ,
for all of you who want to start studying as your good habit, you can pick Ball Cap Nation: A Journey
Through the World of America's National Hat become your own personal starter.

Donna Cauley:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as well as to make
summary for some publication, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or real their
interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing reading
seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring along with can't see colorful photos on
there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this era,
many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore ,
this Ball Cap Nation: A Journey Through the World of America's National Hat can make you sense more
interested to read.
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