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Although the importance of Congregationalism in early Massachusetts has engaged historians' attention for
generations, this study is the first to approach the Puritan experience in Congregational church government
from the perspective of both the pew and the pulpit.

For the past decade, author James F. Cooper, Jr. has immersed himself in local manuscript church records.
These previously untapped documents provide a fascinating glimpse of lay-clerical relations in colonial
Massachusetts, and reveal that ordinary churchgoers shaped the development of Congregational practices as
much as the clerical and elite personages who for so long have populated histories of this period. Cooper's
new findings will both challenge existing models of church hierarchy and offer a new dimension to our
understanding of the origins of New England democracy.

Refuting the idea of clerical predominance in the governance of colonial Massachusetts churches, Cooper
shows that the laity were both informed and empowered to rule with ministers, rather than beneath them.
From the outset of the Congregational experiment, ministers articulated--and lay people embraced--
principles of limited authority, higher law, and free consent in the conduct of church affairs. These principles
were codified early on in the Cambridge Platform, which the laity used as their standard in resisting
infringements upon their rights. By neglecting the democratic components of Congregationalism, Cooper
argues, scholars have missed the larger political significance of the movement. Congregational thought and
practice in fact served as one indigenous seedbed of several concepts that would later flourish during the
Revolutionary generation, including the notions that government derives its legitimacy from the voluntary
consent of the governed, that governors should be chosen by the governed, that rulers should be accountable
to the ruled, and that constitutional checks should limit both the governors and the people.

By examining the development of church government through the perspective of lay-clerical interchange,
Cooper comes to a fresh understanding of the sometimes noble, sometimes sordid, and sometimes rowdy
nature of church politics. His study casts new light upon Anne Hutchinson and the "Antinomian
Controversy," the Cambridge Platform, the Halfway Covenant, the Reforming Synod of 1679, and the long-
standing debate over Puritan "declension." Cooper argues that, in general, church government did not divide
Massachusetts culture along lay-clerical lines, but instead served as a powerful component of a popular
religion and an ideology whose fundamentals were shared by churchgoers and most ministers throughout
much of the colonial era. His is a book that will interest students of American culture, religion, government,
and history.
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From reader reviews:

Christina Moss:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world may
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their
story as well as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
the data about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to
improve their proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of
them is this Tenacious of Their Liberties: The Congregationalists in Colonial Massachusetts (Religion in
America).

Bernadine Parker:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh, do
you consider reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Tenacious of Their
Liberties: The Congregationalists in Colonial Massachusetts (Religion in America) which is obtaining the e-
book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Jon Watson:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Tenacious of Their Liberties: The
Congregationalists in Colonial Massachusetts (Religion in America) was vibrant and of course has pictures
around. As we know that book Tenacious of Their Liberties: The Congregationalists in Colonial
Massachusetts (Religion in America) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until young adults. For
example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore ,
not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the
best book in your case and try to like reading that.

Edward Grimes:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's soul
or real their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this era, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Tenacious of Their Liberties: The Congregationalists in Colonial Massachusetts (Religion in



America) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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