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Summer theme:

Toward a New Creation

This summer, Daily Bible Study presents a series of readings following the theme “Toward a New Creation.”
Readings come from Old and New Testament texts. These daily readings, which prepare us for the 13
lessons in Adult Bible Studies, are written by Gary Thompson, Betty Newman, and Clara Welch.

Judgement and Salvation

Daily Readings in this three-week unit explore the concept of the Day of the Lord, the consequences of
disobedience, and assurances for the faithful.

A World Gone Wrong

Daily readings in this four-week unit caution against ignoring God’s plan truth and ignoring God’s truth
within us. They explore what it means that we are all under sin’s power and point to the way God has set
things right.

Left on God’s Terms

Daily Readings in this six-week unit challenge us to live with hope and remind us that we are raised to a new
life in Christ, are safe in God’s love, and live under God’s mercy. They acknowledge ways God prunes and
crafts us and explain how living in love fulfills the Law.

This ongoing day-by-day Bible study series is presented in quarterly segments. Bible-based, Christ-focused,
and United Methodist-approved, this resource helps individuals develop the discipline of studying the Bible
every day. It coordinates with the lesson themes of Adult Bible Studies. Each lesson includes: a one-page
Bible study for each day of the quarter, along with introductory reflection questions and Commentary on the
daily Scripture passage, Life Application, and a concluding prayer. Available in print and eBook format.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Kerns:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Daily Bible Study Summer 2016, you may tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Mary Crist:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic in the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the book untitled Daily Bible Study Summer 2016 can be great book to read.
May be it could be best activity to you.

Jennifer Shipley:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information quicker
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to
you personally is Daily Bible Study Summer 2016 this publication consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. This book was represented how does the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some exploration when
he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book appropriate all of you.

Siobhan Wilcox:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This Daily Bible Study Summer 2016 can give you a lot
of friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make you actually
more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
guide offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than various other
make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We should have Daily Bible Study Summer 2016.
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