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How does one teach Mark Twain’s Huckleberry Finn, a book as controversial as it is central to the American
literary canon? This collection of essays edited by James S. Leonard offers practical classroom methods for
instructors dealing with the racism, the casual violence, and the role of women, as well as with structural and
thematic discrepancies in the works of Mark Twain.
The essays in Making Mark Twain Work in the Classroom reaffirm the importance of Twain in the American
literature curriculum from high school through graduate study. Addressing slavery and race, gender, class,
religion, language and ebonics, Americanism, and textual issues of interest to instructors and their students,
the contributors offer guidance derived from their own demographically diverse classroom experiences.
Although some essays focus on such works as A Connecticut Yankee in King Arthur’s Court and The
Innocents Abroad, most discuss the hotly debated Adventures of Huckleberry Finn, viewed alternately in this
volume as a comic masterpiece or as evidence of Twain’s growing pessimism—but always as an effective
teaching tool.
By placing Twain’s work within the context of nineteenth-century American literature and culture, Making
Mark Twain Work in the Classroom will interest all instructors of American literature. It will also provoke
debate among Americanists and those concerned with issues of race, class, and gender as they are
represented in literature.

Contributors. Joseph A. Alvarez, Lawrence I. Berkove, Anthony J. Berret, S.J., Wesley Britton, Louis J.
Budd, James E. Caron, Everett Carter, Jocelyn Chadwick-Joshua, Pascal Covici Jr., Beverly R. David, Victor
Doyno, Dennis W. Eddings, Shelley Fisher Fishkin, S. D. Kapoor, Michael J. Kiskis, James S. Leonard,
Victoria Thorpe Miller, Stan Poole, Tom Reigstad, David E. E. Sloane, David Tomlinson
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From reader reviews:

Mamie Wilson:

The book Making Mark Twain Work in the Classroom make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to
use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting
pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make reading a book Making Mark
Twain Work in the Classroom for being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your capable,
increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You could know everything if you like start and
read a book Making Mark Twain Work in the Classroom. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this publication?

Nancy Hunt:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or
woman? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that
question because just their can do in which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person.
Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific Making Mark Twain
Work in the Classroom to read.

James Drennan:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title Making Mark Twain
Work in the Classroom suitable to you? The actual book was written by popular writer in this era. The actual
book untitled Making Mark Twain Work in the Classroomis one of several books that everyone read now.
This kind of book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new
shape that you ever know prior to. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, consequently all of
people can easily to know the core of this book. This book will give you a great deal of information about
this world now. In order to see the represented of the world on this book.

Loretta Manson:

This Making Mark Twain Work in the Classroom is new way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information as it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you
know or else you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Making Mark Twain Work in the
Classroom can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this particular book is easy to get
by simply anyone. These books develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-
book contact form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this reserve is the
answer. So there is no in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should
be here for a person. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book type for your better life as well as knowledge.
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