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Today, black-owned barber shops play a central role in African American public life. The intimacy of
commercial grooming encourages both confidentiality and camaraderie, which make the barber shop an
important gathering place for African American men to talk freely. But for many years preceding and even
after the Civil War, black barbers endured a measure of social stigma for perpetuating inequality: though the
profession offered economic mobility to black entrepreneurs, black barbers were obliged by custom to serve
an exclusively white clientele. Quincy T. Mills traces the lineage from these nineteenth-century barbers to
the bustling enterprises of today, demonstrating that the livelihood offered by the service economy was
crucial to the development of a black commercial sphere and the barber shop as a democratic social space.

Cutting Along the Color Line chronicles the cultural history of black barber shops as businesses and civic
institutions. Through several generations of barbers, Mills examines the transition from slavery to freedom in
the nineteenth century, the early twentieth-century expansion of black consumerism, and the challenges of
professionalization, licensing laws, and competition from white barbers. He finds that the profession played a
significant though complicated role in twentieth-century racial politics: while the services of shaving and
grooming were instrumental in the creation of socially acceptable black masculinity, barbering permitted the
financial independence to maintain public spaces that fostered civil rights politics. This sweeping, engaging
history of an iconic cultural establishment shows that black entrepreneurship was intimately linked to the
struggle for equality.
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From reader reviews:

Hazel Park:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book eligible Cutting
Along the Color Line: Black Barbers and Barber Shops in America? Maybe it is to get best activity for you.
You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before.
Do you agree with its opinion or you have various other opinion?

Glenna Monaghan:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book Cutting Along the Color Line:
Black Barbers and Barber Shops in America. All type of book can you see on many methods. You can look
for the internet options or other social media.

Dwight Ambrose:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice through
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Sure, by
reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than other is high. For you
who want to start reading a new book, we give you this particular Cutting Along the Color Line: Black
Barbers and Barber Shops in America book as nice and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Debra Durso:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Cutting Along the
Color Line: Black Barbers and Barber Shops in America which is having the e-book version. So , why not
try out this book? Let's find.
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