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Walt Whitman’s now-famous maxim about “containing the multitudes” has often been understood as a
metaphor for the democratizing impulses of the young American nation. But did these impulses extend
across the color line? Early in his career, especially in the manuscripts leading up to the first edition of
Leaves of Grass, the poet espoused a rather progressive outlook on race relations within the United States.
However, as time passed, he steered away from issues of race and blackness altogether. These changing
depictions and representations of African Americans in the poetic space of Leaves of Grass and Whitman’s
other writings complicate his attempts to fully contain all of America’s subject-citizens within the national
imaginary. As alluring as “containing the multitudes” might prove to be, African American poets and writers
have been equally vexed by and attracted to Whitman’s acknowledgment of the promise and contradictions
of the United States and their place within it.

Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good Gray Poet explores the meaning of blacks and blackness in
Whitman’s imagination and, equally significant, also illuminates the aura of Whitman in African American
letters from Langston Hughes to June Jordan, Margaret Walker to Yusef Komunyakaa. The essays, which
feature academic scholars and poets alike, address questions of literary history, the textual interplay between
author and narrator, and race and poetic influence. The volume as a whole reveals the mutual engagement
with a matrix of shared ideas, contradictions, and languages to expose how Whitman influenced African
American literary production as well as how African American Studies brings to bear new questions and
concerns for evaluating Whitman.
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From reader reviews:

Lacie Young:

Here thing why this particular Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good Gray Poet (Iowa Whitman
Series) are different and dependable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good however it
depends in the content of it which is the content is as tasty as food or not. Whitman Noir: Black America and
the Good Gray Poet (Iowa Whitman Series) giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find
any publication out there but there is no guide that similar with Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good
Gray Poet (Iowa Whitman Series). It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your own personal eyes
about the thing that will happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. It is possible
to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your means home by train. Should you be having
difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good
Gray Poet (Iowa Whitman Series) in e-book can be your choice.

Paul Butler:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition details. Even you love Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good Gray Poet
(Iowa Whitman Series), you are able to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still desire to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come
on its identified as reading friends.

Cheryl Reese:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Try to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer can be Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good Gray Poet
(Iowa Whitman Series) why because the excellent cover that make you consider concerning the content will
not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your
reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Felix Smith:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This specific book Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good
Gray Poet (Iowa Whitman Series) was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that
book Whitman Noir: Black America and the Good Gray Poet (Iowa Whitman Series) has many kinds or
genre. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and
believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers you



feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that.
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