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The opportunity of repowering the existing condensing power stations by means of  gas turbogenerators
offers an important opportunity to considerably improvement of their energy efficiency. The Modernization
Potential of Gas turbines in the Coal-Fired Power Industry presents the methodology, calculation procedures
and tools used to support enterprise planning for adapting power stations to dual-fuel gas-steam combined-
cycle technologies.

Both the conceptual and practical aspects of the conversion of existing coal-fired power plants is covered.
Discussions of the feasibility, advantages and disadvantages and possible methods are supported by chapters
presenting equations of energy efficiency for the conditions of repowering a power unit by installing a gas
turbogenerator in a parallel system and the results of technical calculations involving the selection heating
structures of heat recovery steam generators. A methodology for analyzing thermodynamic and economic
effectiveness for the selection of a structure of the heat recovery steam generator for the repowered power
unit is also explained.

The Modernization Potential of Gas turbines in the Coal-Fired Power Industry is an informative monograph
written for researchers, postgraduate students and policy makers in power engineering.
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From reader reviews:

Ana Steadman:

This The Modernization Potential of Gas Turbines in the Coal-Fired Power Industry: Thermal and Economic
Effectiveness (SpringerBriefs in Applied Sciences and Technology) book is simply not ordinary book, you
have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is usually information
inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. This particular The Modernization Potential of Gas Turbines in the Coal-Fired
Power Industry: Thermal and Economic Effectiveness (SpringerBriefs in Applied Sciences and Technology)
without we understand teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
become worry The Modernization Potential of Gas Turbines in the Coal-Fired Power Industry: Thermal and
Economic Effectiveness (SpringerBriefs in Applied Sciences and Technology) can bring whenever you are
and not make your case space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop
even cell phone. This The Modernization Potential of Gas Turbines in the Coal-Fired Power Industry:
Thermal and Economic Effectiveness (SpringerBriefs in Applied Sciences and Technology) having very
good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Bryan Rodriguez:

Now a day folks who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the resources
inside it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How many people to be smart in
obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a book can help
folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Modernization Potential of Gas Turbines in the
Coal-Fired Power Industry: Thermal and Economic Effectiveness (SpringerBriefs in Applied Sciences and
Technology) book because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the info in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Maureen Guzman:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Modernization Potential of Gas Turbines in the Coal-
Fired Power Industry: Thermal and Economic Effectiveness (SpringerBriefs in Applied Sciences and
Technology) can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending
your time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the
others?

Jackie Armstrong:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also



know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by book.
Different categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims The
Modernization Potential of Gas Turbines in the Coal-Fired Power Industry: Thermal and Economic
Effectiveness (SpringerBriefs in Applied Sciences and Technology).
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