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In this poetic memoir, which won the Pura Belpré Author Award, was a YALSA Nonfiction Finalist, and
was named a Walter Dean Myers Award Honoree, acclaimed author Margarita Engle tells of growing up as a
child of two cultures during the Cold War.

Margarita is a girl from two worlds. Her heart lies in Cuba, her mother’s tropical island country, a place so
lush with vibrant life that it seems like a fairy tale kingdom. But most of the time she lives in Los Angeles,
lonely in the noisy city and dreaming of the summers when she can take a plane through the enchanted air to
her beloved island. Words and images are her constant companions, friendly and comforting when the
children at school are not.

Then a revolution breaks out in Cuba. Margarita fears for her far-away family. When the hostility between
Cuba and the United States erupts at the Bay of Pigs Invasion, Margarita’s worlds collide in the worst way
possible. How can the two countries she loves hate each other so much? And will she ever get to visit her
beautiful island again?
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From reader reviews:

Angel Echols:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for us
to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading whatever
they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. How about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, individual feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Enchanted Air: Two Cultures, Two Wings: A Memoir.

Jack Crawford:

Precisely why? Because this Enchanted Air: Two Cultures, Two Wings: A Memoir is an unordinary book
that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will shock you with the secret the item
inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who write the book in such incredible way
makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning totally. So ,
it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book
will give you a lot of rewards than the other book possess such as help improving your skill and your critical
thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication
store hurriedly.

Patrick Walker:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet.
Every year seemed to be exactly added. This guide Enchanted Air: Two Cultures, Two Wings: A Memoir
was filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit of a
book, you can sense enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you
wanted.

Samara Reed:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also
you know that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by
book. Different categories of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims
Enchanted Air: Two Cultures, Two Wings: A Memoir.
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