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Is it possible to reach back in time and solve an unsolved murder, more than 170 years after it was
committed? Just after midnight on April 21, 1842, John McLoughlin, Jr. — the chief trader for the Hudson's
Bay Company at Fort Stikine, in the northwest corner of the territory that would later become British
Columbia — was shot to death by his own men. They claimed it was an act of self-defence, their only means
of stopping the violent rampage of their drunk and abusive leader. Sir George Simpson, the HBC's Overseas
Governor, took the men of Stikine at their word, and the Company closed the book on the matter. The case
never saw the inside of a courtroom, and no one was ever charged or punished for the crime. To this day, the
killing remains the Honourable Company's dirtiest unaired laundry and one of the darkest pages in the annals
of our nation's history. Now, exhaustive archival research and modern forensic science — including
ballistics, virtual autopsy, and crime scene reconstruction — unlock the mystery of what really happened the
night McLoughlin died. Using her formidable talents as a writer, researcher, and forensic scientist, Debra
Komar weaves a tale that could almsot be fiction, with larger-than-life characters and dramatic tension. In
telling the story of John McLoughlin, Jr., Komar also tells the story of Canada's north and its connection to
the Hudson's Bay Company.
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From reader reviews:

Geraldine Matson:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want something
to explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare
time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What did you do? Every
individual has many questions above. They must answer that question mainly because just their can do in
which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on pre-
school until university need this particular The Bastard of Fort Stikine: The Hudson's Bay Company and the
Murder of John McLoughlin, Jr. to read.

Thelma Price:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained from the straightway,
hold on guys this specific aren't like that. This The Bastard of Fort Stikine: The Hudson's Bay Company and
the Murder of John McLoughlin, Jr. book is readable by simply you who hate the perfect word style. You
will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving even decrease the
knowledge that want to give to you. The writer regarding The Bastard of Fort Stikine: The Hudson's Bay
Company and the Murder of John McLoughlin, Jr. content conveys objective easily to understand by many
individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different by means of it. So , do
you nonetheless thinking The Bastard of Fort Stikine: The Hudson's Bay Company and the Murder of John
McLoughlin, Jr. is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Ezra Talbott:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book had been rare? Why so
many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes studying, not only science book but in addition novel and The Bastard of Fort Stikine: The Hudson's
Bay Company and the Murder of John McLoughlin, Jr. or others sources were given expertise for you. After
you know how the fantastic a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science publication was created
for teacher as well as students especially. Those guides are helping them to put their knowledge. In some
other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes The Bastard of Fort Stikine: The Hudson's Bay
Company and the Murder of John McLoughlin, Jr. to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of
book like here.

Betty Guinn:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by online on social media. You
can choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is called of
book The Bastard of Fort Stikine: The Hudson's Bay Company and the Murder of John McLoughlin, Jr.. You
can add your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and



make an individual happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you
from one spot to other place.
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