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The New Grand Strategy tells the story of a plan, born within the Pentagon, to recapture America’s greatness
at home and abroad by elevating sustainability as our new strategic imperative. It aligns our enduring
national interests of prosperity and security with a new framework that addresses pressing economic, social,
and environmental issues at home, tapping into a trillion-dollar market demand for walkable communities,
regenerative agriculture and resource productivity. It is an inspiring vision of what’s possible when
Americans hold a collective view of the future and come together to bring it to reality.

This is no idealistic pipe dream or wonky policy prescription. The story that unfolds in this book weaves
together hard-nosed economic analysis, a clear-eyed study of demographic and societal shifts, the realities of
climate change and resource scarcity, a risk-based assessment of America’s challenges and opportunities,
and on-the-ground reporting of how much this is already unfolding throughout the country. By rediscovering
the power and discipline of grand strategy—and taking responsibility for our future—America can reimagine
the American dream and once again take on “the cause of all mankind.”

Released during one of America’s most divisive presidential election campaigns, The New Grand Strategy
avoids the partisan rhetoric dividing our nation today. Instead of placing blame, it offers a clear, pragmatic
plan that can unite Americans and launch a new era of prosperity and security.
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From reader reviews:

Ted Bryant:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get wide
range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely yes. People is human not a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the
particular book you have read is definitely The New Grand Strategy: Restoring America's Prosperity,
Security, and Sustainability in the 21st Century.

Edwin Ball:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
all right you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The New Grand
Strategy: Restoring America's Prosperity, Security, and Sustainability in the 21st Century which is getting
the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Paul Simpson:

This The New Grand Strategy: Restoring America's Prosperity, Security, and Sustainability in the 21st
Century is fresh way for you who has curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger of
knowledge. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having
small amount of digest in reading this The New Grand Strategy: Restoring America's Prosperity, Security,
and Sustainability in the 21st Century can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this
kind of book is easy to get by anyone. These books build itself in the form which can be reachable by
anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in book form make them
feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a e-book especially this
one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the item! Just read
this e-book style for your better life and also knowledge.

William McCown:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you will get it
in e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This kind of The New Grand Strategy: Restoring America's
Prosperity, Security, and Sustainability in the 21st Century can give you a lot of buddies because by you
considering this one book you have issue that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This
particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that might be
your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than various other make you to be great people. So , why



hesitate? We should have The New Grand Strategy: Restoring America's Prosperity, Security, and
Sustainability in the 21st Century.
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