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Triathlet Kais Saisonhöhepunkt ist der Ironman auf Hawaii, für den er vor Ort wochenlang hart trainiert und
seinen Körper an die Grenzen treibt. Für dieses Ziel muss auch seine Beziehung zu Leon zurückstehen, der
sich im heimischen Mecklenburg um den Reitstall kümmert. Zum großen Ereignis fliegt er jedoch ein und
Kai hat noch eine Überraschung für ihn: Einen exklusiven Urlaub im Waikiki Beach Resort.

Diese Kurzgeschichte entstand für die Anthologie der CGA (Cooperation Gay Authors) "Waikiki Beach
Storys und ist ein Spin-Off zu "Mecklenburger Winter", in dem sich Kai und Leon kennen- und lieben
lernen.
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From reader reviews:

Adrienne McGinnis:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the
data about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there
are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their ability in writing,
they also doing some analysis before they write with their book. One of them is this Ironman: Gay Romance
(German Edition).

Nancy Sena:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Ironman: Gay Romance (German Edition) your brain will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in most aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each
word written in a e-book then become one type conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get
previous to. The Ironman: Gay Romance (German Edition) giving you an additional experience more than
blown away the mind but also giving you useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us
explain to you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished
reading through it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time
activity?

Rene King:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
you to definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is Ironman: Gay Romance (German Edition) this e-book consist a lot of the
information with the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how can the world has
grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer
made some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this book acceptable all of you.

Raul Warren:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This reserve Ironman: Gay Romance (German Edition) was filled regarding science.
Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct feel
when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a



publication. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book you wanted.
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