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From Book 1:
Since the day beautiful socialite Afia St. John was born, her life has been plagued with bad luck. After losing
her father and two older husbands in 'freak' accidents, Afia discovers her business manager has absconded
with her fortune. Vowing not to rely on another man to guide her life, Afia refuses her godfathers' help, and
jumps at an unexpected job with Leeds Investigations. With a pregnant, broke, sister and an investigation
agency in the red, control-freak Jake Leeds can't turn down the hefty but secret retainer offered by Afia's
godfather for hiring her. Quickly seeing beyond her poor business skills, wacky superstitions and and
sensationalized personal history, he realizes Afia is as generous in the heart as she is misunderstood. But life
is never easy for the woman born on Friday the 13th. Will the sexy PI be the good luck charm that puts her
on a winning streak or, like everything else in her life, will their relationship wind up Jinxed?
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Smith:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information
inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind
of guide you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want sense happy
read one together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Typically the Friends And Lovers
Collection (3 Book Series) is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Thomas Kelly:

Often the book Friends And Lovers Collection (3 Book Series) will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try to find
new book to see, this book very suited to you. The book Friends And Lovers Collection (3 Book Series) is
much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Karen Garcia:

Friends And Lovers Collection (3 Book Series) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in
words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to
get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Friends And Lovers Collection (3 Book Series)
although doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource data
that maybe you can be among it. This great information may drawn you into new stage of crucial thinking.

Christopher Palmer:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere?
It all right you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Friends And
Lovers Collection (3 Book Series) which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
view.
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