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Mill Power documents the making of a national park that changed the concept of what a national historical
park could be.

For a time in the 1800s, Lowell was Massachusetts’s cosmopolitan, must-see second city. The city’s
industrial model was as high-tech then as Silicon Valley is today. It drew the attention of luminaries like
Charles Dickens, Congressmen Davy Crockett and Abraham Lincoln, feminist sociologist Harriet Martineau,
and abolitionist Frederick Douglass.

This insider’s account of the creative, bold community-driven process to establish the park explains why
today Lowell National Historical Park is renowned as “the partnership park.” The park’s establishment was
an integral piece of an urban revival strategy that has made Lowell the subject of scores of newspaper
articles, magazine profiles, TV and radio reports, scholarly papers, and book chapters.

Historic Preservation magazine has hailed the park as “the premier rehabilitation model for gritty cities
worldwide.” The Lowell story has much to teach the mid-sized cities of the nation and the world.

Mill Power frames the Lowell comeback in its historical context and brings together the people who
dreamed, wrote, designed, pushed, and cheered a new national park into existence along with those who
came after with the charges of shaping the ideas into material form. The volume features 100 photos, many
of them showing the before-and-after story of this revitalization.
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From reader reviews:

Wilma Shay:

The book Mill Power: The Origin and Impact of Lowell National Historical Park can give more knowledge
and also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing
like a book Mill Power: The Origin and Impact of Lowell National Historical Park? Wide variety you have a
different opinion about book. But one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely right.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to give for
each other; you may share all of these. Book Mill Power: The Origin and Impact of Lowell National
Historical Park has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem
the enormous world by open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Eric Beasley:

The actual book Mill Power: The Origin and Impact of Lowell National Historical Park will bring one to the
new experience of reading a book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. Should you try to find
new book to read, this book very ideal to you. The book Mill Power: The Origin and Impact of Lowell
National Historical Park is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book through the
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Carmela Martin:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, limited story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying Mill Power: The Origin
and Impact of Lowell National Historical Park that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied through
reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know
world a great deal better then how they react to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit
only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you
who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick Mill Power: The Origin and Impact of Lowell
National Historical Park become your own starter.

Rachel Wessels:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Mill Power: The Origin and Impact of
Lowell National Historical Park can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so
out of date, spending your free time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So
what these guides have than the others?
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