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The New York Times bestselling author of At the Drop of a Hat returns to her London hat shop with a
fresh tale of milliners and murder.

For Scarlett Parker, part of the fun of living in London is celebrating the British holidays, and she’s excited
to share her first Bonfire Night with her cousin Vivian Tremont. Invited to a posh party by their friend
Harrison Wentworth, Scarlett and Viv decide to promote their hat shop, Mim’s Whims, by donning a few of
their more outrageous creations. The hats prove to be quite the conversation starters as the girls mix and
mingle with the guests—never suspecting that one of them is a killer. 

It’s a cold, clear night, perfect for the British tradition of tossing a straw stuffed effigy of Guy Fawkes, traitor
to the crown, onto the bonfire. But instead of a straw man, they realize in the heat of the moment that the
would-be Guy Fawkes is actually Harrison’s office rival and he’s been murdered. Before the smoke has
cleared, Harrison is the Metropolitan police’s prime suspect, and Scarlett and Vivian must find the real
homicidal hothead before their dear friend’s life goes up in flames.
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From reader reviews:

Mark McCarver:

This book untitled Copy Cap Murder (A Hat Shop Mystery Book 4) to be one of several books this best
seller in this year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will
easily to buy this specific book in the book store or you can order it by way of online. The publisher on this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Cell phone. So there is no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Eric Overbay:

The guide with title Copy Cap Murder (A Hat Shop Mystery Book 4) posesses a lot of information that you
can study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding
the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world right now. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you inside new era of
the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you
want.

Karl Harms:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book entitled Copy
Cap Murder (A Hat Shop Mystery Book 4) your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each word
written in a e-book then become one application form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never
get before. The Copy Cap Murder (A Hat Shop Mystery Book 4) giving you a different experience more than
blown away your mind but also giving you useful info for your better life in this particular era. So now let us
demonstrate the relaxing pattern is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished
examining it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Jesus Rhode:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Copy Cap Murder (A Hat Shop Mystery Book
4) was colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Copy Cap Murder (A Hat Shop
Mystery Book 4) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at
all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose
the best book for yourself and try to like reading that.
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