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Politics and law appear deeply entwined in contemporary international relations. Yet existing perspectives
struggle to understand the complex interplay between these aspects of international life. In this path-breaking
volume, a group of leading international relations scholars and legal theorists advance a new constructivist
perspective on the politics of international law. They reconceive politics as a field of human action that
stands at the intersection of issues of identity, purpose, ethics, and strategy, and define law as an historically
contingent institutional expression of such politics. They explain how liberal politics has conditioned modern
international law and how law 'feeds back' to constitute international relations and world politics. This new
perspective on the politics of international law is illustrated through detailed case-studies of the use of force,
climate change, landmines, migrant rights, the International Criminal Court, the Kosovo bombing campaign,
international financial institutions, and global governance.
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From reader reviews:

Maria Asbury:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book The Politics of International Law
(Cambridge Studies in International Relations) will make you to be smarter. You can feel considerably more
confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think that open or reading a new book
make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking
for best book or suitable book with you?

James Hill:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or
something that they don't need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Politics
of International Law (Cambridge Studies in International Relations). All type of book are you able to see on
many sources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Michael Mantz:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward.
Some of you maybe can update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know which one you should start with. This The Politics of
International Law (Cambridge Studies in International Relations) is our recommendation so you keep up
with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Jason Braden:

A lot of guide has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified as of book The
Politics of International Law (Cambridge Studies in International Relations). You can add your knowledge
by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a person happier to
read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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