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Seminar paper from the year 2005 in the subject American Studies - Literature, grade: 2,0, University of
Frankfurt (Main), 29 entries in the bibliography, language: English, abstract: In the movie The Seven-Per-
Cent-Solution, Sigmund Freud and Sherlock Holmes join their forces in a rather weird series of adventures.
In this paper, these two legendary figures will meet again: Freud, a detective of the unconscious, and
Holmes, the famous Victorian investigator of the criminal side of human nature. The first, a historical
character who has entered popular imagination; the latter, a fictional one so well known that he has often
been taken for real.
So why will they meet again? Well, apart from their love of cocaine , Holmes and Freud share a certain style
of reasoning, more precisely, both of them make use of a method of reading signs known as the “Morelli-
method”. One part of this paper primarily deals with the style of reasoning Sherlock Holmes is making use of
and how he applies his method. Therefore, the term paper will mainly refer to Arthur Conan Doyle`s
detective novels A Scandal in Bohemia and The Sign of Four.
Another part of the paper will give a closer look at Sigmund Freud and his method. Therefore, a short
introduction of his theory of psychoanalysis will be given, followed and underlined by examples from one of
his ingenuous case studies, commonly known as The Wolf-Man. Especially the centerpiece of this case-
study, the analysand`s dream, will be discussed.
After that the collected similarities between Sherlock Holmes and Sigmund Freud respectively the analogies
between the literary and the scientific discourse of the time of the late 19th and the early 20th century will be
summarized. This will form the main part of this paper. It will turn out that Holmes and the Viennese
professor do not only use a similar method to solve their cases – which is well observed and described by
Carlo Ginzburg in the essay Morelli, Freud, and Sherlock Holmes: Clues and Scientific Method. Even the
narrative structure of their case-studies is of striking ressemblance.
The conlusion will emphasise in general the importance of Holmes and Freud for the Victorian society of
their days. But before shedding some light on these two brilliant thinkers, it is necessary to take a short
glimpse on the so-called and already mentioned “Morelli-method”.
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From reader reviews:

Louie Thompson:

Here thing why this particular What`s your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction, dear Freud, deduction! are
different and dependable to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good however it depends in the content
of computer which is the content is as yummy as food or not. What`s your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction,
dear Freud, deduction! giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any guide out there
but there is no guide that similar with What`s your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction, dear Freud, deduction!.
It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing that happened in the world
which is maybe can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your
method home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of What`s
your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction, dear Freud, deduction! in e-book can be your option.

Mary Russell:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your
totally free time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read.
If you want to try out look for book, may be the guide untitled What`s your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction,
dear Freud, deduction! can be great book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Marcos Anderson:

This What`s your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction, dear Freud, deduction! is great e-book for you because
the content which is full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make decision
every minute. That book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can state no
rambling sentences inside. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it
only provides straight forward sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences.
Having What`s your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction, dear Freud, deduction! in your hand like keeping the
world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no book that offer you world
throughout ten or fifteen minute right but this publication already do that. So , this really is good reading
book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt which?

Lurline Silvester:

You will get this What`s your method Mr. Holmes? Deduction, dear Freud, deduction! by look at the
bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by simply written or printed and also can you enjoy
this book by simply e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and



searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about
your publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try
to choose correct ways for you.
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