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Drawing is "the very essence of all pictorial art," and this book approaches the challenging art of animal
painting from the point of view of accurate representation of animal subjects on canvas. Combining useful
information on important anatomical features with direction on how to handle the subjects and how to
express their forms and postures, the author has produced a complete, inexpensive, at-home course in animal
painting and anatomy.
All aspects of animal drawing and painting are covered: drawing from life; anatomy in relation to drawing
(not surgical anatomy, but a precise knowledge of the visible structure and movements of animals);
characteristic movements of animals and suggestions on how to capture them in your picture; composition
(design, restraint, rhythm, balance of light and shade, relative scale of animals and landscape, foregrounds);
painting and color. 36 illustrations, mostly sketches by the author, depict horses, pigs, cows, dogs, and other
animals in various life positions and movements.
A long, detailed discussion of the anatomy of animals completes the book. Here Mr. Calderon describes all
the structures of animals that are of significance to the artist: the vertebral skeleton, the bones and muscles of
the head, the muscles of the vertebral skeleton, the fore-limb and its muscles, the muscles attaching the
shoulder blade to the trunk, and the bones and muscles of the hind limb. 208 drawings accompany these
discussions and show you how anatomy is related to surface contours and techniques of shading.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Ziegler:

The book Animal Painting and Anatomy (Dover Anatomy for Artists) give you a sense of feeling enjoy for
your spare time. You may use to make your capable more increase. Book can for being your best friend
when you getting stress or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book
Animal Painting and Anatomy (Dover Anatomy for Artists) being your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You
could know everything if you like available and read a publication Animal Painting and Anatomy (Dover
Anatomy for Artists). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other
people. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Diana Pearson:

This Animal Painting and Anatomy (Dover Anatomy for Artists) is great guide for you because the content
and that is full of information for you who have always deal with world and also have to make decision
every minute. This book reveal it details accurately using great coordinate word or we can point out no
rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it
only provides straight forward sentences but difficult core information with wonderful delivering sentences.
Having Animal Painting and Anatomy (Dover Anatomy for Artists) in your hand like keeping the world in
your arm, info in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no e-book that offer you world within ten or fifteen
minute right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. busy do
you still doubt that will?

Phillip Chadwick:

Is it anyone who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Animal Painting and Anatomy (Dover
Anatomy for Artists) can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides
have than the others?

Benjamin Herrera:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This reserve Animal Painting and Anatomy (Dover Anatomy for Artists) was filled with
regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some
people has diverse feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can sense
enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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