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There is a widespread belief that reason and faith are incompatible and opposed to each other. Faith is
viewed as subjective, emotional, a crutch for those who find the real world too hard. Though many of the
world’s finest minds hold this view, the Bible teaches that it is the fool who says there is no God.

Dr. R. C. Sproul clearly and simply argues that at its core Christianity is rational. He focuses on defending
the basic truth claims for two of the most crucial issues of apologetics: God’s existence and the Bible’s
authority.

In this primer of apologetic thought, Dr. Sproul affirms four logical principles that are necessary for all real
discussion and teaches you how to defend your faith in a faithless world. Using the writings of church fathers
and philosophers throughout the ages, he uncovers the common ideologies that work against faith.

The defense of the faith is not a luxury or an intellectual vanity. It is a task appointed by God that you should
be able to give a reason for the hope that is in you as you bear witness before the world.
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Garza:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book called Defending Your
Faith: An Introduction? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time
together with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have
some other opinion?

Lillian Carlucci:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content.
As we know that book is very important usually. The book Defending Your Faith: An Introduction ended up
being making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The publication Defending Your Faith: An Introduction is not only giving you much
more new information but also for being your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your personal
spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship using the book Defending Your Faith: An
Introduction. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some books.

Elizabeth Sherer:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of a number of ways
to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people.
When you read this Defending Your Faith: An Introduction, it is possible to tells your family, friends and
soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a guide.

Cara Shaver:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen will need book to know the upgrade information of year in order to year. As we know those guides
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. Through the
book Defending Your Faith: An Introduction we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be
creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book that
acceptable with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life by this book Defending Your Faith: An
Introduction. You can more inviting than now.
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