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Los catorce relatos que componen Swingers se desarrollan en una época ambigua -¿mediados del siglo
XXI?-, donde hay nuevas leyes genéticas y eugenésicas ya en vigor, y grandes corporaciones tienen el
control de la clonación en la Tierra. En ese mundo «feliz» los seres humanos buscan respuestas a sus delirios
y sueños en la creación de clones y duplicados, como lo hace un científico clandestino al crear a una mujer
alada que supone su gran invención o un esposo desesperado que da forma a un doble para que satisfaga los
deseos sexuales de su mujer.
Un libro futurista que nos instala en el fin de los tiempos, pero donde todo acontece de manera
imperceptible, con un dejo de nostalgia, antecedido por la desidia general.
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From reader reviews:

Curtis Russell:

This Swingers (Spanish Edition) book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you
will get data which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This particular
Swingers (Spanish Edition) without we understand teach the one who reading through it become critical in
imagining and analyzing. Don't always be worry Swingers (Spanish Edition) can bring when you are and not
make your bag space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even
cell phone. This Swingers (Spanish Edition) having excellent arrangement in word and layout, so you will
not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Erna Taylor:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to anyone is
you don't know which one you should start with. This Swingers (Spanish Edition) is our recommendation to
help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Candy Dixon:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge even the
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what
kind of book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want truly
feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Swingers
(Spanish Edition) is kind of book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Betsy Aguilar:

This Swingers (Spanish Edition) is great book for you because the content and that is full of information for
you who all always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal
it details accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences in it. So if you are
read the item hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Swingers (Spanish Edition)
in your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no e-
book that offer you world within ten or fifteen second right but this publication already do that. So , this can
be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?
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